
For more information, visit the Indiana Nonprofits: Scope and Community Dimensions Project at  
www.indiana.edu/~nonprof 

 

 
 

 
 

 

Indiana Local Government Officials: Exploring Support for PILOTs  
(Payments-in-Lieu of Taxes) 

 
Kirsten Grønbjerg and Kellie McGiverin-Bohan with Lauren Dula and Rachel Miller 

Briefing Number 5, Spring 2016 
 

This briefing explores reasons why Local Gov-
ernment Officials (LGOs) in Indiana may sup-
port requiring charities that own real estate to 
make payments in lieu of [property] taxes (PI-
LOTs). Using survey and administrative data,1 
we find that indicators of economic distress, tax 
equity, political forces, relationships between 
nonprofits and local government, and LGOs’ 
personal involvement with nonprofits may in-
fluence LGOs’ support of PILOTS.  

This is the fifth in a series of briefings from the 
Indiana Nonprofits: Scope and Community Di-
mensions project that focuses on nonprofit-
government relations in Indiana. The first four 
briefings explored LGOs’ attitudes toward 2-1-1 
services, PILOT and SILOT policies, collaboration 
between local government and nonprofits, and 
LGO trust in nonprofits. These briefings are 
available at the project website: www.indi-
ana.edu/~nonprof/results/specialsurveys/lo-
calgovt.php.  

This briefing expands upon briefing No. 2 where 
we focused on the extent to which LGOs sup-
port PILOTs and SILOTs (services in lieu of 
taxes) for particular types of charities or gov-
ernment entities.2 PILOT policies have received 
more attention nationally and are of most con-
cern to nonprofits because they impose cash 
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Quick Facts 

 PILOTs, or “payments in lieu of taxes,” are 
payments (e.g., fees) that charities (and 
some other organizations) may be required 
to make to local governments in lieu of taxes. 
SILOTs are “services in lieu of taxes.” 

 When only considering PILOT fees, 41 per-
cent of LGOs support requiring nonprofit uni-
versities/schools to pay PILOTs to local com-
munities, 34 percent support hospital PILOTs, 
and 27 percent support church PILOTs.  

 Controlling for all other factors, LGOs are 
more likely to support PILOTs if their commu-
nities are undergoing economic distress, 
have instituted tax increment financing, are 
urban counties, or have high nonprofit as-
sets. Support is also high for LGOs from coun-
ties with high voter turnout and those who 
believe government should exert control 
over nonprofits.  

 Factors that predict LGO support for PILOTs 
is fairly consistent for universities/schools, 
hospitals, and churches.  

 When asked specifically which considerations 
were important for requiring PILOT policies, 
LGOs gave most weight to the need for tax 
revenues and whether nonprofits provide 
valuable services. 
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outlays. This briefing therefore focuses exclu-
sively on PILOT policies and explores possible 
reasons why LGOs may support such policies.  

What are PILOTs and why are they im-
portant? 

Under the Indiana State Constitution, the Gen-
eral Assembly may provide property tax exemp-
tions for “property being used for municipal, 
educational, literary, scientific, religious or 
charitable purposes.”3 Such exemptions benefit 
charitable nonprofits that own real estate and 
implicitly acknowledge the public value of their 
services to local communities.4  

Nationally, the estimated foregone revenue (or 
tax expenditures) from nonprofit property tax 
ranges from $9 to $32 billion, not counting reli-
gious organizations.5,6 Similar estimates are not 
available for Indiana, although the aggregate 
dollar value of the exemption is likely to exceed 
$200 million for the state as a whole.7  

In 2012, Indiana’s 3,231 units of local govern-
ment relied on property taxes for about 23 per-
cent of their total revenues and 80 percent of 
all tax revenues under their control. This is 
down from respectively 31 and 90 percent in 
2007 and reflects the decline in property taxes 
from $8.4 billion to $6.4 billion during that pe-
riod.8 Consequently, the property tax cap that 
Indiana voters approved in 2010 means that 
many local governments in Indiana have en-
countered new challenges in providing im-
portant services, most notably for local public 
schools and police and fire services.  

Faced with decreasing revenues and growing 
budgetary pressures, especially in the wake of 
the Great Recession, it is not surprising that 
many municipalities have begun to reconsider 
nonprofit property tax exemptions.9 So far, at 
least 154 jurisdictions in 27 states have sought 
to impose mandatory fees for municipal ser-
vices from organizations owning real estate 

that is otherwise exempt from property taxes.10 
Indiana is typical of most states in having only a 
handful of documented PILOT policies in 
place.11  Most such policies target hospitals, 
universities, museums, camps, and other chari-
ties with substantial real estate holdings 

As Matt Greller, executive director of the Indi-
ana Association of Cities and Towns, noted: 
“[w]e’re having to look at the public services 
nonprofits use and how we can adequately 
cover those costs… We can’t give them away 
for free any longer.”12  

Not surprisingly, many nonprofits are con-
cerned about sentiments similar to those of 
Matt Greller. In Indiana, these concerns have 
increased in light of recent PILOT policy discus-
sions by the Indiana legislature.13 As a result, 
the Indiana Association of United Ways has 
added this topic to its list of top policy priorities 
for 2016 and issued a statement on nonprofit 
property tax exemption.14  

Other nonprofits, including the National Associ-
ation of Independent Schools, vigorously op-
pose mandatory payments, pointing to their 
nonprofit tax-exempt status and the important 
community services they provide.15 Similarly, 
the National Council of Nonprofits ranks PI-
LOTs, taxes and fees as first among its list of 
“Clear and Present Dangers” to the social com-
pact between governments and nonprofits.16  

Which charities should be subject to 
PILOTs? 

Local government officials were more in favor 
of requiring PILOTs from universities and 
schools than hospitals or churches.  

More than two-fifths (41 percent) of local gov-
ernment officials said they were in favor of re-
quiring PILOTs from private universities or 
schools, compared to about a third (34 percent) 
who said hospitals should pay (Figure 1). Sur-
prisingly, given the separation of church and 
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state in the U.S., about a quarter (27 percent) 
of LGOS said churches should make payments 
in lieu of real estate taxes.17  

Figure 1: Percent of Indiana LGOs Supporting 
PILOTS for Three Types of Charities  

 

What explains LGO support for PILOTs? 

We turn now to a closer look at what may ex-
plain support for PILOTs by Indiana LGOs. Spe-
cifically:  

 Are LGOs more likely to support PILOT poli-
cies if their communities are facing economic 
distress? 

 Is support for PILOTs related to tax equity is-
sues, such as whether nonprofits have the 
ability to pay or own larger shares of prop-
erty? 

 Do political forces matter, such as voter par-
ticipation or the type of government position 
held by the LGO?  

 Does it matter what LGOs think about the re-
lationship between nonprofits and local gov-
ernment? 

 Is the support by LGOs for PILOTs related to 
their own personal involvement with non-
profits?  

Figure 2 shows how we expect these factors to 
operate. We use responses to the 2010 IACIR 
survey of LGOs together with county-level in-
formation about the communities the LGOs 
represent to capture the particular explanatory 
factors. We then subject these measures to 
multi-variate analyses to determine whether 

the combination of factors predict LGO support 
for PILOT policies for universities or schools, 
hospitals, and churches. 

Figure 2: Model Explaining LGO Support for PI-
LOT Policies 

 

Is economic distress related to support for 
PILOTs?  

Declining federal and state aid, efforts to re-
duce taxes (such as tax caps), and decreasing 
tax bases have squeezed the budgets of many 
local governments. The Great Recession and 
the collapse of the housing market further ag-
gravated fiscal distress for local governments 
by reducing receipts from sales, income, and 
property tax collections.  

Our multivariate analysis shows that three 
measures of local economic distress are im-
portant in LGO attitudes. Specifically, LGOs are 
more likely to support PILOTs if their counties 
have high levels of unemployment, are urban 
counties, or have already used TIFs in response 
to the property tax cap (the latter is only mar-
ginally important for predicting support for PI-
LOTs from churches). 

In an attempt to test if LGOs will be more likely 
to support PILOTs if their communities face 
economic distress, we considered the level of 
unemployment or whether LGOs report using 
Tax Increment Financing districts (TIFs) in re-
sponse to the Property Tax Cap approved by 
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votes in 2010 (about one-third of LGO respond-
ents report using TIFs in this manner).  

We also thought local governments in urban 
communities might face greater economic dis-
tress since they are likely to have a greater con-
centration of property-holding charities (hospi-
tals, universities and schools, churches, cultural 
institutions, and large social service agencies) 
than their rural counterparts.   

Figure 3 shows the results for each type of 
charity but includes only those measures that 
are important in the final analysis. 

Figure 3: Analysis predicting LGO support for 
requiring PILOTs for hospitals, educa-
tional institutions, and churches 

 

Is support for PILOTs related to tax equity 
issues?  

In addition to pressures from economic dis-
tress, tax equity concerns may play a role. Con-
trolling for all other factors, we find that sup-
port for PILOTs is higher among LGOs from 
counties where nonprofits assets are high, but 
measures of horizontal equity do not seem to 
matter. Indeed, support for PILOTs for educa-
tional institutions is marginally lower if non-
profits own a high proportion of local property. 

When examining questions of equity, we con-
sidered LGO concerns for both vertical and hor-
izontal equity. Vertical equity refers to a non-
profit’s ability to pay property taxes, and here 
we used total nonprofit assets as a proxy to de-
termine nonprofit ability to pay.  

Horizontal equity refers to a situation in which 
tax burdens are distributed equally across 
equally-able payers. We used the share of local 
property owned by nonprofits to indicate the 
tax burden that charitable property tax exemp-
tions place on other property owners. We also 
consider whether the county already has a PI-
LOT in place since horizontal equity would sug-
gest that other charities might then be required 
to make similar payments. 

Is support for PILOTs related to political 
concerns?  

Controlling for all other factors, support for PI-
LOTs for universities and schools, hospitals, 
and churches is stronger among LGOs from 
counties with high voter participation. We also 
find that county-level LGOs are more likely to 
support PILOTs, but only for churches. 

Given the stakes involved for both local govern-
ment and charities, LGOs are likely to face com-
plex political interests when weighting PILOTs. 
In Indiana, pervasive resistance to property 
taxes surfaced in the 2010 election when 72 
percent of voters endorsed a constitutional 
amendment to cap property taxes. Thus, we 
are not surprised that LGOs in more politically 
active counties, as indicted by voter participa-
tion in the 2010 November election, are more 
likely to support PILOTs. Additionally, county 
officials administer property taxes and may be 
most concerned about voter preferences. 

Does it matter how LGOs view govern-
ment-nonprofit relationships?  

Controlling for all other factors, we find that 
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support for PILOTs for all three types of chari-
ties is significantly higher among LGOs who 
agree that local government should be able to 
exert some control over nonprofits. We also 
find that LGOs who report contracting with 
nonprofits to deliver services are less likely to 
support PILOTs, but only in the case of educa-
tional institutions. 

Local governments collaborate with nonprofits 
in a variety of ways, such as contracting with 
them to deliver services or inviting them to par-
ticipate in task forces. It is therefore reasonable 
that LGOs who say their unit of government 
contracts with nonprofits to deliver services or 
who in general endorse collaboration between 
nonprofits and local government will be less 
likely to support PILOTs.  

However, tensions may also arise, especially if 
collaboration is less well developed or institu-
tionalized. Under these circumstances, we 
would expect LGOs who believe government 
should exert control over nonprofits to be more 
likely to support PILOTs.  

Does it matter whether LGOs are person-
ally involved with nonprofits?  

We find that support for PILOTS is lower 
among LGOs who say their personal volunteer 
activities are important for their own govern-
ment work, but only in the case of PILOTs from 
hospitals. Contrary to expectations, support for 
PILOTs from churches is higher among LGOs 
who are involved in a large number of non-
profit areas.  

In addition to their political and professional at-
titudes, LGOs’ personal nonprofit experiences 
may influence their support for PILOTs. How-
ever, given the mixed findings, it is unclear how 
these experiences affect LGO attitudes.  
 

Conclusion and Policy Implications 
Our analysis focused on attitudes towards PI-
LOTs rather than on whether such policies exist 

in local communities. While there are only a 
few known PILOT agreements in Indiana, our 
findings suggest that support for such policies is 
relatively widespread and follows predictable 
patterns. In fact, Indiana state legislators have 
considered several PILOT-related policies and 
recently passed a bill restricting PILOT agree-
ments in TIF areas.18 It is therefore important to 
better understand how LGOs rationalize their 
positions on PILOT policies.  

We have preliminary indications of what LGOs 
think from the 2014 IACIR survey which asked 
respondents to indicate how important each of 
ten issues are to them when thinking about im-
posing PILOTs on nonprofits. These questions 
were designed to capture several key argu-
ments policy makers use when discussing or 
proposing such policies. 

These arguments include most notably fiscal 
justifications (the need for more tax revenues), 
but also equity issues. The latter takes several 
forms. Some arguments focus on the fact that 
large charities (hospitals and universities in par-
ticular) use high volumes of municipals services 
(e.g., fire, police, sanitation) that are financed 
at least in part from property taxes. Conse-
quently, the exemption of these charities from 
property taxes imposes non-trivial tax burdens 
on other property owners. Other equity issues 
focus more explicitly on unfair competition and 
whether exemption gives nonprofits an unfair 
advantage over for-profit businesses.  

We also asked about considerations that might 
be seen as pro-charities, such as how important 
it is to LGOs whether nonprofits have the finan-
cial ability to pay taxes, whether property tax 
exemption allows local government to support 
nonprofits, and whether LGOs are concerned 
about the financial burden PILOTs would im-
pose on nonprofits. Finally, we asked how im-
portant it is to LGOs how their constituents per-
ceive PILOTs and whether it is important to 
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consider the costs and logistics of implement-
ing such policies.  

Figure 4 presents a preliminary analysis of the 
responses to these questions in the 2014 sur-
vey. We grouped the ten items into three broad 
categories: considerations that have relatively 
negative implications for nonprofits (first five 
columns), considerations that have relatively 
positive implications for nonprofits (last four 
columns), and one intermediary consideration 
(what constituents think).  

As the figure shows, the need for tax revenues 
is considered very important by almost two-
fifths of the LGOs and more than half (54 per-
cent) say it is at least fairly important. On the 
other hand, about the same (54 percent) say it 
is at least fairly important that nonprofits pro-
vide valuable services and more than a third 
(34 percent) say it is very important. The re-
maining eight considerations appear to be sig-
nificantly less important than the need for tax 

revenue and the services nonprofits provide.  

These data are only preliminary, and we do not 
yet have a fully-cleaned set of survey responses 
from the 2014 survey. As a result, we do not 
know how any of the policy rationales included 
in Figure 4 relate to support for PILOT policies 
or how they play themselves out across differ-
ent types of charities.  

However, it seems clear that nonprofit leaders 
and philanthropic policy makers should pay 
careful attention to budget constraints faced by 
units of local government. Equally important, 
they should be ready to document the valuable 
services charities provide to local communities, 
since this appears to be an argument policy 
makers are ready to consider. Finally, they 
should be able to demonstrate how PILOTs 
would burden their ability to provide such ser-
vices and explain how the exemption from 
property (and other) taxes is an important way 
in which government helps nonprofits provide 

Figure 4: Importance of Issues for Requiring PILOT Payments from Nonprofits (N-488-511) 
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such services.  

In the final analysis, there are other, less dam-
aging avenues for alleviating fiscal constraints 
of local government than imposing PILOTs on 
local charities. As noted by the Indiana Commis-
sion on Local Government Reform in 2007,19 In-
diana’s system of local government is highly in-
efficient and streamlining the system would re-
sult in significant cost savings.  
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1 In 2010, the Indiana Advisory Commission on Intergov-
ernmental Relations (IACIR) surveyed nearly 1,150 local 
government officials including mayors, county auditors, 
county commissioners, county and town council mem-
bers, school board members, and township trustees. The 
response rate was 35 percent. A summary of findings 
from the full 2010 survey can be found at the IACIR web-
site: www.iacir.spea.iupui.edu [Palmer, J., Wyeth, D., 
with Chang, J. (2010). Intergovernmental Issues in Indi-
ana: 2010 IACIR Survey. Indiana Advisory Commission on 
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cluded questions that explicitly probed for why LGOs 
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This briefing is based in part on a more exten-
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PILOT and SILOT policies forthcoming in the 
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abbreviated analyses, using a different set of 
explanatory factors, were published in Acad-
emy of Management Proceedings (2014) 21 and 
in Nonprofit Policy Forum (2016).22  
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